
This Will Not Pass: A Journey into the Heart of
the Global Revolt
In the winter of 2019, the world erupted in a wave of uprisings. From Chile
to Lebanon, from Hong Kong to Iraq, people took to the streets to demand
change. These protests were not about a single issue or a single country—
they were about a global system that is failing to meet the needs of its
people.
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In This Will Not Pass, journalist Martin Lukacs travels to the front lines of
these uprisings to meet the people who are fighting for a better future. He
talks to protesters, activists, and leaders, and he hears their stories of
hope, courage, and determination.

Lukacs shows that these uprisings are not just about anger and frustration.
They are about a deep-seated desire for change. People are tired of living
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in a world where the rich get richer and the poor get poorer. They are tired
of being treated like commodities by corporations and governments. They
are tired of living in a world where there is no justice.

The uprisings of 2019-2020 are a sign of hope. They show that people are
no longer willing to accept the status quo. They are demanding change,
and they are not going to give up until they get it.

This Will Not Pass is a powerful and inspiring book that tells the story of a
global revolt. It is a must-read for anyone who wants to understand the
challenges facing our world today and the people who are fighting to make
it a better place.

The Global Revolt

The global revolt of 2019-2020 was a wave of protests and demonstrations
that took place in over 100 countries around the world. The protests were
sparked by a variety of factors, including economic inequality, political
corruption, and environmental degradation.

In some countries, the protests were led by specific groups, such as the
yellow vests in France or the protesters in Hong Kong. In other countries,
the protests were more spontaneous and leaderless.

Despite the diversity of the protests, they all shared a common goal: to
demand change. The protesters were calling for an end to austerity,
corruption, and inequality. They were also demanding greater democracy
and accountability from their governments.



The global revolt was a major challenge to the status quo. It showed that
people around the world are no longer willing to accept the status quo.
They are demanding change, and they are not going to give up until they
get it.

Chile

The protests in Chile began in October 2019 over a hike in subway fares.
However, the protests quickly grew into a broader movement against
inequality and corruption.

The protests in Chile were marked by violence, with rioting and looting
taking place in some cities. However, the protests also showed the
resilience and determination of the Chilean people. The protesters refused
to give up, even in the face of police violence.

In November 2019, the Chilean government agreed to hold a referendum
on a new constitution. The referendum, which was held in October 2020,
resulted in a vote in favor of a new constitution.

The new constitution is expected to include a number of progressive
measures, such as a guaranteed minimum wage, universal healthcare, and
environmental protections. The adoption of a new constitution is a major
victory for the Chilean people and a sign of the potential for change that the
global revolt has unleashed.

Lebanon

The protests in Lebanon began in October 2019 over a proposed tax on
WhatsApp calls. However, the protests quickly grew into a broader
movement against corruption and inequality.



The protests in Lebanon were marked by their peaceful nature. The
protesters refused to be provoked by the government, even when the
government used violence against them.

The protests in Lebanon led to the resignation of Prime Minister Saad
Hariri. However, the protests continue, as the Lebanese people demand a
new government that is free of corruption and committed to reform.

The protests in Lebanon are a reminder that the global revolt is not just
about anger and frustration. It is also about a deep-seated desire for
change. The Lebanese people are tired of living in a country where
corruption is rampant and the government is unresponsive to their needs.
They are demanding change, and they are not going to give up until they
get it.

Hong Kong

The protests in Hong Kong began in June 2019 over a proposed extradition
law. However, the protests quickly grew into a broader movement for
democracy and autonomy.

The protests in Hong Kong have been marked by their creativity and
resilience. The protesters have used a variety of tactics to avoid police
violence, including wearing masks and using umbrellas as shields.

The protests in Hong Kong have also been marked by their violence. The
police have used tear gas, rubber bullets, and water cannons against the
protesters. Several protesters have been killed.



Despite the violence, the protesters in Hong Kong have refused to give up.
They are demanding genuine democracy and autonomy, and they are not
going to give up until they get it.

Iraq

The protests in Iraq began in October 2019 over unemployment and
corruption. However, the protests quickly grew into a broader movement
against the government.

The protests in Iraq have been marked by their violence. The security
forces have used live ammunition against the protesters, killing hundreds of
people.

Despite the violence, the protesters in Iraq have refused to give up. They
are demanding a new government that is free of corruption and committed
to reform.

The protests in Iraq are a reminder that the global revolt is not just about
anger and frustration. It is also about a deep-seated desire for change. The
Iraqi people are tired of living in a country where corruption is rampant and
the government is unresponsive to their needs. They are demanding
change, and they are not going to give up until they get it.

The Future of the Global Revolt

The global revolt of 2019-2020 is a major challenge to the status quo. It
shows that people around the world are no longer willing to accept the
status quo. They are demanding change, and they are not going to give up
until they get it.



The future of the global revolt is uncertain. However, one thing is clear: the
protests have shown that there is a deep-seated desire for change around
the world. People are tired of living in a world where the rich get richer and
the poor get poorer. They are tired of being treated like commodities by
corporations and governments. They are tired of living in a world where
there is
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Hulusi Darende's Poems: Unraveling the Lyrical
Tapestry of a Turkish Mystic
: A Journey into the Heart of Sufi Mysticism Hulusi Darende, a renowned
Turkish Sufi poet and mystic of the 13th century, left behind a legacy of
profoundly moving poems...
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Act of Terror: A Jericho Quinn Thriller
In the heart-pounding thriller Act of Terror, FBI Special Agent Jericho
Quinn is called in to investigate a devastating terrorist attack on a major
city. As...
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